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Abstract: In view of this article, it is nothing but just a mind set up that Madhusudan had 
introduced a revolutionary attitude towards Ramayana studies. Rather we believe that at 
least in case of Sita, he took the same policy like Balmiki, that the character should 
remain within the comfort zone of AamAadmi as well as reach a new horizon of 
intellectuality. Here we have to admit that Madhusudan never placed a word on Sita's 
monologue which could discomfort old mentallited. His Sita had very traditional 
approaches to Rama. On the other hand It is very significant that Madhusudan made a 
room for Sita that She could speak Her own. She cxperienced that nobody, including Her 
mother, are not interested to save Her. All the so called good parties waited badly to 
create a rape condition just to fulfil their political ambition. It knocked Sita in deep and 
She committed an alternative modernity. The Lady realised that Her love to the spouse, 
Her deepest feelings for all in the world, are not going to be considered by the men of 
Her own, more over an insecurity over powered, Madhusudan's Sita started to realise 
that Rama had no more concern with her. The battle is being fought to satisfy egos. She 
found that the rest was just dark. It was quite possible that the character may conclude in 
Europcan alienation, specially when the poct promised to maintain the Western structure. 
But it was Madhusudan's subconscious. His Sita took a very Indian approach. Instead of 
all the rough She never lost Her deep personalised peace, never blamed anybody, even 
cnemies. She lived for love and had tried to overpowering the evil by love. She had the 
sense that SATITYA is not just a practice but a life to enjoy. Here we tried to locate the 
sprite of the lady as directed by Madhusudan- in direct words or through sensibility. 
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